
16 Years Since the August war
Sixteen years have passed since the August war. In August 2008, the Russian 
Federation invaded the territory of Georgia in violation of international law, infringed 
Georgia's sovereignty, commited war crimes and crimes against humanity. This 
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invasion resulted in the killing of civilians and the forced displacement of 26,888 
people (9,081 families). 1

The damage caused by the Russian Federation is ongoing. The human rights situation 
of people living in the occupied territories and the harassment of ethnic Georgians 
remain problematic. 2 Additionally, creeping occupation, illegal so-called 
 ᰀ戀漀爀搀攀爀椀稀愀琀椀漀渠ᴀⰀ and security challenges persist for people living near the occupation 
line.3 The occupation regime has exacerbated the issue with the illegal practice of 
arresting people for allegedly crossing the so-called border, leading to increasing 
cases of long-term illegal detention. 4 The killing of Tamaz Ginturi by the Russian 
occupation forces during an attempt to illegally arrest a local resident near the village 
of Kirbali in Gori municipality is another egregious violation of human rights by the 
occupation regime. 5

Along with the security challenges, the population living in the villages near the 
occupation line faces significant social and economic difficulties, including high 
unemployment, low awareness of social programs, and lack of access to basic 
services and infrastructure. 6

This situation is exacerbated by the fact that the compensation obligation imposed on 
Russia by the European Court is still unenforceable. On April 28, 2023, the European 
Court ordered the Russian Federation to pay 130 million euros to Georgia in the 
August War case,7 based on its decision from January 21, 2021, on the interstate 
dispute. 8 However, the Russian Federation does not cooperate with international 
organizations and is currently excluded from the Council of Europe. Its declared policy 
is to not fulfill the obligations imposed by the European Court, including the payment 
of the imposed compensation amount.

On 26 January 2024, GYLA addressed the Ministry of Foreign Affairs of Georgia to 
utilize available resources and take further actions to create an international 
compensation fund for the victims of the Russian Federation as a result of the August 
war and subsequent developments under the auspices of the Council of Europe.9

GYLA's appeal has not yet received any feedback from the Ministry of Foreign Affairs 
of Georgia. 10 It is necessary for the state to use all diplomatic and international legal 
mechanisms to ensure the enforcement of the European Court of Human Rights' 
decision against Russia.
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Instead, the Georgian authorities are openly fighting against civil society, which plays 
an important role in protecting the rights of people affected by the conflict at both 
international and national levels, with the Russian law. The Russian law and other 
excessively restrictive measures also threaten the country's Euro-Atlantic course, 11 

which is reinforced by the Constitution of Georgia and represents an important 
guarantee of the protection of Georgia's sovereignty and territorial integrity.
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